

# Saint Vincent and the Grenadines' Digital Transformation Project

Equipment to Upgrade the Governments Local Area Network

- Lot 1: Computer and Network Equipment,
- Lot 2: Centralized Wi-Fi,
- Lot 3: Air- Conditioning Units
- Lot 4: Fibre Installation

RFP No: SVGCARDTP-G-RFB-1

## CONTRACT AWARD NOTICE

<b>Name and address of the Borrower's Project Implementation Unit undertaking the procurement, and if different, the Borrower's contracting agency</b>	Ministry of Finance, Economic Planning and Information Technology 2 <sup>nd</sup> Floor, Administrative Building, Bay Street Kingstown Saint Vincent and the Grenadines																
<b>Names of all Bidders/Proposers/Consultants that submitted bids/Proposals, and their Bid/Proposal prices as read out at Bid/Proposal opening, and as evaluated</b>	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse; margin-bottom: 10px;"> <thead> <tr> <th style="text-align: left;"><i>Names of Bidder</i></th> <th style="text-align: center;"><i>Lot 1 / XCD</i></th> <th style="text-align: center;"><i>Lot 2/ XCD</i></th> <th style="text-align: center;"><i>Lot 4 / XCD</i></th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>1. Computer and Electrical Services Ltd</td> <td style="text-align: center;">782,760.00</td> <td style="text-align: center;">No bid</td> <td style="text-align: center;">No bid</td> </tr> <tr> <td>2. MAVCOM</td> <td style="text-align: center;">1,239,375.70</td> <td style="text-align: center;">447,392.30</td> <td style="text-align: center;">No bid</td> </tr> <tr> <td>3. Cable &amp; Wireless</td> <td style="text-align: center;">1,410,731.33</td> <td style="text-align: center;">734,437.95</td> <td style="text-align: center;">9,911.56</td> </tr> </tbody> </table> <p>No bids were received for lot 3.</p>	<i>Names of Bidder</i>	<i>Lot 1 / XCD</i>	<i>Lot 2/ XCD</i>	<i>Lot 4 / XCD</i>	1. Computer and Electrical Services Ltd	782,760.00	No bid	No bid	2. MAVCOM	1,239,375.70	447,392.30	No bid	3. Cable & Wireless	1,410,731.33	734,437.95	9,911.56
<i>Names of Bidder</i>	<i>Lot 1 / XCD</i>	<i>Lot 2/ XCD</i>	<i>Lot 4 / XCD</i>														
1. Computer and Electrical Services Ltd	782,760.00	No bid	No bid														
2. MAVCOM	1,239,375.70	447,392.30	No bid														
3. Cable & Wireless	1,410,731.33	734,437.95	9,911.56														
<b>Names of Bidders/Proposers/Consultants whose Bids/Proposals were rejected whether as nonresponsive or as not meeting qualification criteria, or were not evaluated, with the reasons therefor</b>	<p>None of the bids were non-responsive.</p>																
<b>The name of the successful Bidder/Proposer/Consultant, the final total contract price, the contract duration, and a summary of its scope</b>	<table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse;"> <thead> <tr> <th style="text-align: left;"><i>Lot number and details</i></th> <th style="text-align: left;"><i>Name of Successful Bidder Contract Price   Contract duration</i></th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Lot 1 – computer and network equipment</td> <td>Computer and Electrical Services XCD 782,760.00   40 days</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Lot 2 – Equipment for centralised Wi-Fi</td> <td>MAVCOM 447,392.30   60 days</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Lot 4 – underground installation of fibre between ITSD and Central Police Station</td> <td>Cable &amp; Wireless 9,911.56   60 days</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	<i>Lot number and details</i>	<i>Name of Successful Bidder Contract Price   Contract duration</i>	Lot 1 – computer and network equipment	Computer and Electrical Services XCD 782,760.00   40 days	Lot 2 – Equipment for centralised Wi-Fi	MAVCOM 447,392.30   60 days	Lot 4 – underground installation of fibre between ITSD and Central Police Station	Cable & Wireless 9,911.56   60 days								
<i>Lot number and details</i>	<i>Name of Successful Bidder Contract Price   Contract duration</i>																
Lot 1 – computer and network equipment	Computer and Electrical Services XCD 782,760.00   40 days																
Lot 2 – Equipment for centralised Wi-Fi	MAVCOM 447,392.30   60 days																
Lot 4 – underground installation of fibre between ITSD and Central Police Station	Cable & Wireless 9,911.56   60 days																